
17-5043
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92)

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP I ITEM 1:   HEX NUTS, FINE THREAD - STAINLESS STEEL TYPE 18-8 SS, SAWS NO. 32203 UNIT

100 ea.                 PRICE 2.66 2.86
1. 1/4" TOTAL 2.66 2.86

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.70 4.36
2. 5/16" TOTAL 4.70 4.36

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.73 5.42
3. 3/8" TOTAL 4.73 5.42

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 10.44 11.43
4. 7/16" TOTAL 10.44 11.43

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 13.95 14.20
5. 1/2" TOTAL 13.95 14.20

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 31.25 21.69
6. 9/16" TOTAL 31.25 21.69

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 29.32 30.12
7. 5/8" TOTAL 58.64 60.24

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 48.08 42.19
8. 3/4" TOTAL 48.08 42.19

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 107.93 155.06
9. 1" TOTAL 107.93 155.06

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 378.00 222.24
10. 1-1/8" TOTAL 378.00 222.24

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 462.00 384.91
11. 1-1/4" TOTAL 462.00 384.91

TOTAL ITEM 1 TOTAL 1,122.38 924.60
ITEM NO. 2:  HEX NUTS, COARSE THREAD, SAWS NO. 32204 UNIT

2000 ea.                           PRICE 2.40 2.69
1. 1/4" TOTAL 48.00 53.80

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 3.41 3.97
2. 5/16" TOTAL 10.23 11.91

 UNIT

1500 ea. PRICE 4.88 5.92
3. 3/8" TOTAL 73.20 88.80

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 9.66 10.36
4. 7/16" TOTAL 19.32 20.72
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
as
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 UNIT

200 ea.                                     PRICE 11.82 14.00
5. 1/2" TOTAL 23.64 28.00
  UNIT

1000 ea. PRICE 23.13 30.74
6. 9/16" TOTAL 231.30 307.40

 UNIT

15,000 ea. PRICE 21.05 25.94
7. 5/8" TOTAL 3,157.50 3,891.00

 UNIT

1,500 ea. PRICE 36.13 41.47
8. 3/4" TOTAL 541.95 622.05

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 40.56 67.17
9. 7/8" TOTAL 202.80 335.85

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 73.50 102.71
10. 1" TOTAL 367.50 513.55
  UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 154.00 196.96
11. 1-1/8" TOTAL 770.00 984.80

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 187.20 278.59
12. 1-1/4" TOTAL 936.00 1,392.95

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 340.40 565.93
13. 1-1/2" TOTAL 1,702.00 2,829.65

TOTAL ITEM 2 TOTAL 8,083.44 11,080.48
ITEM 3: HEX LOCK NUTS WITH NYLON INSERTS, SAWS NO. 32205 UNIT

500 ea.                         PRICE 3.49 3.50
1. 1/4" TOTAL 17.45 17.50

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 4.32 4.67
2. 5/16" TOTAL 21.60 23.35

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 7.39 7.57
3. 3/8" TOTAL 36.95 37.85

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 10.79 8.98
4. 7/16" TOTAL 53.95 44.90

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 15.37 18.72
5. 1/2" TOTAL 76.85 93.60

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 68.52 181.28
6. 9/16" TOTAL 342.60 906.40
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
as
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TOTAL ITEM 3 TOTAL 549.40 1,123.60
ITEM 4:  LARGE FENDER WASHERS, SAWS NO. 32206 UNIT

300 ea.                       PRICE 3.92 4.50
1. 1/4" x 1" TOTAL 11.76 13.50

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 8.90 10.22
2. 1/4" x 1-1/2" TOTAL 26.70 30.66

TOTAL ITEM 4 TOTAL 38.46 44.16
ITEM 5:  LOCK WASHERS, SAWS NO. 32207 UNIT

900 ea.                         PRICE 1.31 1.13
1. 1/4" TOTAL 11.79 10.17

 UNIT

1800 ea. PRICE 2.18 1.78
2. 5/16" TOTAL 39.24 32.04

 UNIT

1100 ea. PRICE 3.44 2.88
3. 3/8" TOTAL 37.84 31.68

 UNIT

700 ea. PRICE 6.07 4.34
4. 7/16" TOTAL 42.49 30.38

 UNIT

1000 ea. PRICE 7.31 5.88
5. 1/2" TOTAL 73.10 58.80

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 22.40 11.88
6 9/16" TOTAL 112.00 59.40

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 10.08 10.81
7. 5/8" TOTAL 50.40 54.05

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 21.52 16.84
8. 3/4" TOTAL 64.56 50.52

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 41.06 32.54
9. 7/8" TOTAL 123.18 97.62

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 52.53 58.03
10. 1" TOTAL 157.59 174.09

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 0.90 0.33
11. #6 TOTAL 0.90 0.33

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.10 0.39
12. #8 TOTAL 1.10 0.39
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
as
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UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.23 0.52
13. #10 TOTAL 1.23 0.52

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.30 0.77
14. #12 TOTAL 2.30 0.77

TOTAL ITEM 5 TOTAL 717.72 600.76
ITEM 6:  FLAT WASHERS, SAWS NO. 32208 UNIT

2400 ea.                 PRICE 0.98 1.05
1. 1/4" TOTAL 23.52 25.20

 UNIT

1600 ea. PRICE 1.44 1.50
2. 5/16" TOTAL 23.04 24.00

 UNIT

2200 ea. PRICE 1.98 2.41
3. 3/8" TOTAL 43.56 53.02

 UNIT

1400 ea. PRICE 5.04 4.77
4. 7/16" TOTAL 70.56 66.78

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 4.85 6.25
5. 1/2" TOTAL 24.25 31.25

UNIT

400 ea. PRICE 17.55 4.67
6. 9/16" TOTAL 70.20 18.68

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 8.70 11.28
7. 5/8" TOTAL 17.40 22.56

 UNIT

600 ea. PRICE 18.47 19.77
8. 3/4" TOTAL 110.82 118.62

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 19.36 25.28
9. 7/8" TOTAL 19.36 25.28

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 18.34 27.71
10. 1" TOTAL 18.34 27.71

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.20 0.23
11. #6 TOTAL 1.20 0.23

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.20 0.33
12. #8 TOTAL 1.20 0.33

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.16 0.43
13. #10 TOTAL 2.16 0.43
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.60 0.61
14. #12 TOTAL 3.60 0.61

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.04 1.05
15. 1/4" x 5/8" TOTAL 1.04 1.05

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.54 1.50
16. 5/16" x 3/4" TOTAL 1.54 1.50

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.11 2.41
17. 3/8" x 7/8" TOTAL 2.11 2.41

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.38 4.77
18. 7/16" x 1 1/18" TOTAL 5.38 4.77

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.17 6.25
19. 1/2" x 1 1/4" TOTAL 5.17 6.25

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.28 11.28
20. 5/8" x 1 1/2" TOTAL 9.28 11.28

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 18.47 19.77
21. 3/4" x 1 3/4" TOTAL 18.47 19.77

TOTAL ITEM 6 TOTAL 472.20 461.73
ITEM 7: METRIC HEX HEAD CAP SCREWS, SAWS NO. 32209 UNIT

100 ea.                PRICE 5.09 5.71
1. 6 mm x 25 TOTAL 5.09 5.71

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 8.42 8.77
2. 6 mm x 50 TOTAL 8.42 8.77

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.76 10.95
3. 8 mm x 25 TOTAL 9.76 10.95

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 15.44 17.05
4. 8 mm x 50 TOTAL 15.44 17.05

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.56 19.89
5. 10 mm x 25 TOTAL 16.56 19.89

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 23.56 31.71
6. 10 mm x 50 TOTAL 23.56 31.71

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 26.48 26.96
7. 12 mm x 25 TOTAL 26.48 26.96
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 39.27 44.08
8 12 mm x 50 TOTAL 39.27 44.08

TOTAL ITEM 7 TOTAL 144.58 165.12
ITEM 8:  HEX NUT METRIC, SAWS NO. 32210 UNIT

100 ea.             PRICE 1.76 1.79
1. 6 mm TOTAL 1.76 1.79

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.42 3.76
2. 8 mm TOTAL 3.42 3.76

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 7.62 8.39
3. 10 mm TOTAL 7.62 8.39

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 11.81 12.42
4. 12 mm TOTAL 11.81 12.42

TOTAL ITEM 8 TOTAL 24.61 26.36
ITEM 9:  METRIC FLAT WASHERS, SAWS NO. 32211 UNIT

100 ea.         PRICE 1.43 0.79
1. 6 mm TOTAL 1.43 0.79

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.13 1.37
2. 8 mm TOTAL 2.13 1.37

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.30 2.83
3. 10 mm TOTAL 3.30 2.83

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.06 5.17
4. 12 mm TOTAL 6.06 5.17

TOTAL FOR ITEM 9 TOTAL 12.92 10.16
ITEM 10:  MACHINE SCREWS (round head, pan head and flat head; also slotted & phillips drive)  

SAWS NO. 32212 UNIT

100 ea.                PRICE 1.40 0.88
1. 4-40 x 1/2 TOTAL 1.40 0.88

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.90 0.94
2. 4-40 x 3/4 TOTAL 1.90 0.94

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.94 1.19
3. 4-40 x 1 TOTAL 1.94 1.19

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.62 1.43
4. 4-40 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 2.62 1.43
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ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.40 2.08
5. 4-40 x 2 TOTAL 4.40 2.08

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.00 1.08
6. 6-32 x 1/2 TOTAL 2.00 1.08

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.23 1.33
7. 6-32 x 3/4 TOTAL 2.23 1.33

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.74 1.59
8. 6-32 x 1 TOTAL 2.74 1.59

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.47 2.04
9. 6-32 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 3.47 2.04

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.14 3.02
10. 6-32 x 2 TOTAL 4.14 3.02

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.23 1.61
11. 8-32 x 1/2 TOTAL 2.23 1.61

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.99 2.06
12. 8-32 x 3/4 TOTAL 2.99 2.06

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.98 2.51
13. 8-32 x 1 TOTAL 3.98 2.51

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.44 2.25
14. 10-24 x 1/2 TOTAL 3.44 2.25

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.41 2.69
15. 10-24 x 3/4 TOTAL 4.41 2.69

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.04 3.16
16. 10-24 x 1 TOTAL 5.04 3.16

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.56 4.28
17. 10-24 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 6.56 4.28

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 7.54 5.05
18. 10-24 x 2 TOTAL 7.54 5.05

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.20 2.26
19. 10-32 x 1/2 TOTAL 3.20 2.26

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.52 2.83
20. 10-32 x 3/4 TOTAL 3.52 2.83
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.96 3.37
21. 10-32 x 1 TOTAL 4.96 3.37

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.91 2.85
22. 12-24 x 1/2 TOTAL 3.91 2.85

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.51 4.14
23. 10-24 x 3/4 TOTAL 4.51 4.14

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.18 5.00
24. 10-24 x 1 TOTAL 5.18 5.00

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.51 6.54
25. 10-24 x 1-12 TOTAL 6.51 6.54

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 8.26 5.05
26. 10-24 x 2 TOTAL 8.26 5.05

TOTAL FOR ITEM 10 TOTAL 103.08 71.23
ITEM 11:  SOCKET SET SCREWS, SAWS NO. 32213 UNIT

100 ea.                          PRICE 6.32 4.48
1. 3/8-24 x 1/4 TOTAL 6.32 4.48

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 11.75 9.58
2. 3/8-16 x 3/4 TOTAL 11.75 9.58

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 636.90 126.60
3. 1-8 x 1 TOTAL 636.90 126.60

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 990.00 180.03
4. 7/8 9 x 1 TOTAL 990.00 180.03

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 150.70 327.07
5. 5/8-18 x 1 TOTAL 150.70 327.07

 UNIT   
100 ea. PRICE 106.19 327.07

6. 5/8-18 x 5/8 TOTAL 106.19 327.07
 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 52.36 36.96
7. 5/8-11 x 1 TOTAL 52.36 36.96

 UNIT

 100 ea. PRICE 39.16 26.12
8. 5/8 x 11 x 3/4 TOTAL 39.16 26.12

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 34.01 25.93
9. 5/8-11 x 5/8 TOTAL 34.01 25.93
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
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PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 34.69 31.71
10 5/8-11 x 1/2 TOTAL 34.69 31.71

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 36.33 26.53
11. 1/2-20 x 1 TOTAL 36.33 26.53

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 30.07 21.75
12. 1/2-20 x 3/4 TOTAL 30.07 21.75

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.53 13.87
13. 1/2-20 x 1/2 TOTAL 16.53 13.87

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 29.53 20.69
14. 1/2-13 x 1 TOTAL 29.53 20.69

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 29.25 24.34
15 1/2-13 x 7/8 TOTAL 29.25 24.34

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 20.16 15.39
16. 1/2-13 x 3/4 TOTAL 20.16 15.39

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 18.05 12.16
17. 1/2-13 x 5/8 TOTAL 18.05 12.16

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.35 11.45
18. 1/2-13 x 1/2 TOTAL 16.35 11.45

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 14.00 11.46
19. 1/2-13 x 3/8 TOTAL 14.00 11.46

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 31.02 23.10
20. 7/16-20 x 1 TOTAL 31.02 23.10

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 32.20 27.15
21. 7/16-20 x 7/8 TOTAL 32.20 27.15

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 22.12 17.72
22. 7/16-20 x 3/4 TOTAL 22.12 17.72

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 20.44 21.75
23. 7/16-20 x 5/8 TOTAL 20.44 21.75

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 17.19 15.17
24. 7/16-20 x 1/2 TOTAL 17.19 15.17

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 18.20 11.50
25. 7/16-20 x 7/16 TOTAL 18.20 11.50
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 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 31.43 11.50
26. 7/16-20 x 3/8 TOTAL 31.43 11.50

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 27.52 19.33
27. 7/16-14 x 1 TOTAL 27.52 19.33

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 29.40 19.33
28. 7/16-14 x 7/8 TOTAL 29.40 19.33

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 20.15 14.74
29. 7/16-14 x 3/4 TOTAL 20.15 14.74

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 19.52 15.09
30. 7/16-14 x 5/8 TOTAL 19.52 15.09

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.58 11.70
31. 7/16-14 x 1/2 TOTAL 16.58 11.70

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 33.31 10.31
32. 7/16-14 x 7/16 TOTAL 33.31 10.31

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 30.20 11.07
33. 7/16-14 x 3/8 TOTAL 30.20 11.07

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.66 10.10
34. 3/8-24 x 3/4 TOTAL 16.66 10.10

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 13.98 7.82
35. 3/8-24 x 5/8 TOTAL 13.98 7.82

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.68 6.75
36. 3/8-24 x 1/2 TOTAL 9.68 6.75

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 7.81 6.07
37. 3/8-24 x 3/8 TOTAL 7.81 6.07

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 8.14 4.48
38. 3/8-24 x 1/4 TOTAL 8.14 4.48

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 11.86 7.89
39. 3/8-16 x 5/8 TOTAL 11.86 7.89

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 14.46 9.58
40. 3/8-16 x 3/4 TOTAL 14.46 9.58

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 8.24 5.93
41. 3/8-16 x 1/2 TOTAL 8.24 5.93
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 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.11 7.29
42. 3/8-16 x 7/16 TOTAL 16.11 7.29

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 7.06 4.60
43. 3/8-16 x 3/8 TOTAL 7.06 4.60

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.88 4.71
44. 3/8-16 x 5/16 TOTAL 6.88 4.71

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.74 4.09
45. 3/8-16 x 1/4 TOTAL 6.74 4.09

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 11.25 7.33
46. 5/16-24 x 3/4 TOTAL 11.25 7.33

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.50 5.91
47. 5/16-24 x 5/8 TOTAL 9.50 5.91

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.50 5.90
48. 5/16-24 x 1/2 TOTAL 6.50 5.90

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 11.82 4.51
49. 5/16-24 x 7/16 TOTAL 11.82 4.51

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.14 4.51
50. 5/16-24 x 3/8 TOTAL 5.14 4.51

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.72 3.13
51. 5/16-24 x 5/16 TOTAL 4.72 3.13

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.21 3.12
52. 5/16-24 x 1/4 TOTAL 4.21 3.12

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.30 6.48
53. 5/16-18 x 3/4 TOTAL 9.30 6.48

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 7.50 5.31
54. 5/16-18 x 5/8 TOTAL 7.50 5.31

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 7.06 4.24
55. 5/16-18 x 1/2 TOTAL 7.06 4.24

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.34 4.33
56. 5/16-18 x 7/16 TOTAL 6.34 4.33

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.18 2.89
57. 5/16-18 x 3/8 TOTAL 5.18 2.89
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 4.21 2.88
58. 5/16-18 x 5/16 TOTAL 4.21 2.88

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.54 2.94
59. 5/16-18 x 1/4 TOTAL 3.54 2.94

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 12.80 9.69
60. 5/16-18 x 1 TOTAL 12.80 9.69

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.40 4.69
61. 1/4-28 x 5/8 TOTAL 6.40 4.69

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.70 2.90
62. 1/4-28 x 1/2 TOTAL 5.70 2.90

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.82 2.54
63. 1/4-28 x 3/8 TOTAL 3.82 2.54

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.64 7.11
64. 1/4-20 x 3/16 TOTAL 2.64 7.11

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.86 1.70
65. 1/4-20 x 1/4 TOTAL 2.86 1.70

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.17 1.98
66. 1/4-20 x 5/16 TOTAL 3.17 1.98

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.45 1.85
67. 1/4-20 x 3/16 TOTAL 2.45 1.85

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.64 1.43
68. 1/4-20 x 1/4 TOTAL 2.64 1.43

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.34 2.34
69. 1/4-20 x 5/16 TOTAL 3.34 2.34

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.54 1.80
70. 1/4-28 x 3/8 TOTAL 3.54 1.80

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.28 1.43
71. 1/4-28 x 1/2 TOTAL 5.28 1.43

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.74 3.92
72. 1/4-28 x 5/8 TOTAL 6.74 3.92

TOTAL FOR ITEM 11 TOTAL 2,906.90 1,668.82
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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ITEM 12: Hex Head Bolts Coarse Thread, SAWS NO. 32214 UNIT

400 ea.                 PRICE 3.60 4.53
1. 1/4 x 1/2 TOTAL 14.40 18.12

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 4.14 5.55
2. 1/4 x 3/4 TOTAL 20.70 27.75

 UNIT

700 ea. PRICE 4.98 6.46
3. 1/4 x 1 TOTAL 34.86 45.22

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 5.85 7.86
4. 1/4 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 11.70 15.72

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 7.28 9.11
5. 1/4 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 14.56 18.22

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 8.40 10.12
6. 1/4 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 8.40 10.12

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 9.00 11.72
7. 1/4 x 2 TOTAL 27.00 35.16

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 10.44 12.39
8. 1/4 x 2 1/4 TOTAL 31.32 37.17

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 11.36 13.96
9. 1/4 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 34.08 41.88

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 14.01 16.98
10. 1/4 x 3 TOTAL 28.02 33.96

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 17.82 18.01
11. 1/4 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 53.46 54.03

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 57.11 92.56
12. 9/16 x 1 TOTAL 57.11 92.56

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 51.17 54.70
13. 9/16 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 51.17 54.70

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 62.54 57.58
14 9/16 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 125.08 115.16

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 75.10 59.24
15. 9/16 x 2 TOTAL 225.30 177.72

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 80.68 71.778
16. 9/16 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 242.04 215.33
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

150 ea. PRICE 85.62 93.49
17. 9/16 x 3 TOTAL 128.43 140.24

 UNIT

150 ea. PRICE 99.78 102.29
18. 9/16 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 149.67 153.44

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.23 7.47
19. 5/16 x 1/2 TOTAL 6.23 7.47

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.83 8.98
20. 5/16 x 3/4 TOTAL 6.83 8.98

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 8.31 10.64
21. 5/16 x 1 TOTAL 41.55 53.20

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 9.93 12.15
22. 5/16 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 19.86 24.30

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 11.27 14.47
23. 5/16 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 22.54 28.94

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 16.11 19.13
24. 5/16 x 2-1/4 TOTAL 32.22 38.26

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 18.12 22.01
25. 5/16 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 18.12 22.01

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 21.53 25.30
26. 5/16 x 3 TOTAL 21.53 25.30

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 23.09 24.51
27. 5/16 x 3-1/4 TOTAL 23.09 24.51

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 21.75 27.58
28. 5/16 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 43.50 55.16

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 29.23 30.53
29. 5/16 x 4 TOTAL 58.46 61.06

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 50.22 58.70
30. 5/8 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 50.22 58.70

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 52.28 60.77
31. 5/8 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 52.28 60.77

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 51.00 69.31
32. 5/8 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 51.00 69.31
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 53.14 73.00
33. 5/8 x 2 TOTAL 265.70 365.00

 UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 63.09 88.44
34. 5/8 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 1,577.25 2,211.00

 UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 73.80 103.08
35. 5/8 x 3 TOTAL 1,845.00 2,577.00

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 87.15 115.88
36. 5/8 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 174.30 231.76

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 85.15 131.17
37. 5/8 x 4 TOTAL 85.15 131.17

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 100.24 143.12
38. 5/8 x 4-1/2 TOTAL 100.24 143.12

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 100.00 158.01
39. 5/8 x 5 TOTAL 100.00 158.01

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 112.04 172.95
40. 5/8 x 5-1/2 TOTAL 112.04 172.95

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 129.48 188.81
41. 5/8 x 6 TOTAL 129.48 188.81

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 154.70 212.93
42. 5/8 x 6-1/2 TOTAL 154.70 212.93

 UNIT

400 ea. PRICE 10.54 13.29
43. 3/8 x 3/4 TOTAL 42.16 53.16

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 12.80 15.47
44. 3/8 x 1 TOTAL 38.40 46.41

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 14.93 17.88
45. 3/8 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 29.86 35.76

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 16.80 20.86
46. 3/8 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 50.40 62.58
   UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 20.84 23.57
47. 3/8 x 2 TOTAL 104.20 117.85

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 25.38 30.10
48. 3/8 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 25.38 30.10
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 31.84 34.41
49. 3/8 x 3 TOTAL 31.84 34.41

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 44.18 44.21
50. 3/8 x 4 TOTAL 44.18 44.21

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 48.74 50.38
51. 3/8 x 4 1/2 TOTAL 48.74 50.38

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 63.71 64.88
52. 3/8 x 5 1/2 TOTAL 63.71 64.88

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 58.86 65.00
53 3/8 x 6 TOTAL 58.86 65.00

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 67.60 75.00
54. 3/8 x 6-1/4 TOTAL 135.20 150.00

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 17.86 19.52
55. 7/16 x 1 TOTAL 35.72 39.04

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 19.18 22.65
56. 7/16 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 19.18 22.65

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 25.36 26.22
57. 7/16 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 50.72 52.44

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 33.18 29.43
58. 7/16 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 66.36 58.86

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 36.19 34.30
59. 7/16 x 2 TOTAL 36.19 34.30
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 41.33 40.05
60. 7/16 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 41.33 40.05

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 40.52 46.59
61. 7/16 x 3 TOTAL 81.04 93.18

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 63.47 55.25
62. 7/16 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 126.94 110.50

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 63.05 62.60
63. 7/16 x 4 TOTAL 126.10 125.20

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 64.58 74.08
64. 7/16 x 4-1/2 TOTAL 129.16 148.16
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 23.69 29.356
65. 1/2 x 1 TOTAL 71.07 88.07

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 26.25 32.51
66. 1/2 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 52.50 65.02

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 33.09 35.78
67. 1/2 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 33.09 35.78

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 38.45 38.24
68. 1/2 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 38.45 38.24

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 39.68 44.46
69. 1/2 x 2 TOTAL 39.68 44.46

 UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 48.14 53.23
70. 1/2 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 1,203.50 1,330.75

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 48.00 66.59
71. 1/2 x 3 TOTAL 144.00 199.77

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 55.92 71.90
72. 1/2 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 55.92 71.90

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 51.48 77.79
73. 1/2 x 3-3/4 TOTAL 51.48 77.79
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 49.45 81.01
74. 1/2 x 4 TOTAL 49.45 81.01

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 55.76 112.01
75. 1/2 x 4-1/2 TOTAL 55.76 112.01

 UNIT

 100 ea. PRICE 61.75 102.80
76. 1/2 x 5 TOTAL 61.75 102.80

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 71.32 112.88
77. 1/2 x 5-1/2 TOTAL 142.64 225.76

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 129.09 NO BID
78. 1/2 x 5-3/4 TOTAL 129.09  

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 64.29 100.24
79. 3/4 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 64.29 100.24

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 69.77 107.70
80. 3/4 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 69.77 107.70
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 73.84 114.35
81. 3/4 x 2 TOTAL 73.84 114.35

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 87.65 120.49
82. 3/4 x 2-1/4 TOTAL 87.65 120.49

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 105.68 128.59
83. 3/4 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 211.36 257.18
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 121.23 153.83
84. 3/4 x 3 TOTAL 121.23 153.83

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 124.55 165.01
85. 3/4 x 3-1/4 TOTAL 1,245.50 1,650.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 130.99 173.23
86 3/4 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 1,309.90 1,732.30

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 146.75 196.08
87. 3/4 x 4 TOTAL 146.75 196.08

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 151.20 219.70
88. 3/4 x 4-1/2 TOTAL 151.20 219.70

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 162.00 237.95
89. 3/4 x 5 TOTAL 162.00 237.95

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 135.59 164.56
90. 7/8 x 2 TOTAL 135.59 164.56

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 141.75 201.48
91. 7/8 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 141.75 201.48

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 151.25 219.07
92. 7/8 x 3 TOTAL 151.25 219.07

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 180.00 251.98
93. 7/8 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 180.00 251.98

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 180.00 278.33
94. 7/8 x 3-3/4 TOTAL 180.00 278.33

 UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 232.00 286.60
95. 7/8 x 4 TOTAL 464.00 573.20

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 253.50 361.79
96. 7/8 x 5 TOTAL 253.50 361.79
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SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 197.50 270.74
97. 1 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 197.50 270.74

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 208.75 314.64
98. 1 x 3 TOTAL 208.75 314.64

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 260.00 380.62
99. 1 x 4 TOTAL 260.00 380.62

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 312.50 428.01
100. 1 x 4-1/2 TOTAL 312.50 428.01

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 325.00 466.44
101. 1 x 5 TOTAL 325.00 466.44

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 437.50 476.55
102. 1-1/8 x 2-3/4 TOTAL 437.50 476.55

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 576.25 662.72
103. 1-1/4 x 3 TOTAL 576.25 662.72

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 612.50 739.56
104. 1-1/4 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 612.50 739.56
 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 900.00 739.57
105. 1-1/4 x 4-3/4 TOTAL 900.00 739.57

 UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 714.00 1,004.64
106. 1-1/4 x 5 TOTAL 2,142.00 3,013.92

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 804.00 1,045.49
107. 1-1/4 x 5-1/2 TOTAL 804.00 1,045.49

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 840.00 1,099.11
108. 1-1/4 x 6 TOTAL 840.00 1,099.11

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1,736.00 1,595.00
109. 1-3/8 x 7 TOTAL 1,736.00 1,595.00

TOTAL FOR ITEM 12 TOTAL 24,576.72 30,769.40
ITEM 13:  HEX HEAD BOLTS, FINE THREAD, SAWS NO. 32215 UNIT

100 ea.            PRICE 5.81 5.44
1. 1/4 x 1/2 TOTAL 5.81 5.44

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.40 5.79
2. 1/4 x 3/4 TOTAL 6.40 5.79
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 6.96 6.48
4. 1/4 x 1 TOTAL 6.96 6.48

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.98 7.83
5. 1/4 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 9.98 7.83

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 12.82 8.34
6. 1/4 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 12.82 8.34

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 17.25 10.85
7. 1/4 x 2 TOTAL 17.25 10.85
  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 9.84 7.15
8. 5/16 x 1/2 TOTAL 9.84 7.15
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 10.66 9.86
9. 5/16 x 3/4 TOTAL 10.66 9.86

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 12.03 10.18
10. 5/16 x 1 TOTAL 12.03 10.18

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 15.41 13.10
11. 5/16 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 15.41 13.10

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 16.42 14.68
12. 5/16 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 16.42 14.68

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 27.10 55.44
13. 5/16 x 2-1/4 TOTAL 27.10 55.44
  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 18.93 15.13
14. 3/8 x 1 TOTAL 18.93 15.13

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 19.14 17.03
15. 3/8 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 19.14 17.03

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 23.47 19.24
16. 3/8 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 23.47 19.24

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 36.80 25.00
17. 3/8 x 2 TOTAL 36.80 25.00

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 28.33 22.56
18. 7/16 x 1 TOTAL 28.33 22.56

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 38.69 21.37
19. 7/16 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 38.69 21.37
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
as

tS
er

v
 S

u
p

p
ly

P
D

 M
o

rr
is

o
n

 E
n

te
rp

ri
se

s,
 I

n
c.

 

D
b

a 
P

D
M

E

1
1

2
0

 T
o

ro
 G

ra
n

d
e 

D
r.

, 
B

ld
g

. 
2

, 

S
te

. 
2

0
8

C
ed

ar
 P

ar
k

, 
T

X
 7

8
6

1
3

S
W

T
 Q

u
al

it
y

 F
as

te
n

er
s 

1
0

4
0

5
 I

H
 3

5
 N

S
an

 A
n

to
n

io
, 
T

X
 7

8
2

3
3

N
A

P
P

C
O

 F
as

te
n

er
 C

o
.

  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 34.80 28.71
20. 7/16 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 34.80 28.71
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 51.40 34.00
21. 7/16 x 2 TOTAL 51.40 34.00

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 35.71 35.00
22. 1/2  x 1 TOTAL 35.71 35.00

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 38.69 34.35
23. 1/2 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 38.69 34.35

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 38.84 42.26
24. 1/2 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 38.84 42.26

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 38.95 47.59
25. 1/2 x 2 TOTAL 38.95 47.59
  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 69.49 60.19
26. 9/16 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 69.49 60.19

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 79.29 67.91
27. 9/16 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 79.29 67.91

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 100.09 51.37
28. 9/16 x 2 TOTAL 100.09 51.37

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 70.46 59.30
29. 5/8 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 70.46 59.30

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 79.59 67.16
30. 5/8 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 79.59 67.16

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 79.30 78.94
31. 5/8 x 2 TOTAL 79.30 78.94

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 141.70 103.32
32. 3/4 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 141.70 103.32

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 145.60 135.63
33. 3/4 x 2 TOTAL 145.60 135.63

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 550.00 236.94
34. 1 x 2 TOTAL 550.00 236.94

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3,125.00 401.95
35. 1-1/8 x 2 TOTAL 3,125.00 401.95
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3,500.00 548.24
35. 1-1/4 x 2 TOTAL 3,500.00 548.24
 

TOTAL FOR ITEM 13 TOTAL 8,494.95 2,308.33
 ITEM 14:  ALLEN SOCKET HEAD CAP SCREWS,COARSE THREAD, SAWS NO. 32216 UNIT

100 ea.   PRICE 1.72 1.12
1. 6/32 x 1/4 TOTAL 1.72 1.12
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.00 1.05
2. 6/32 x 3/8 TOTAL 2.00 1.05

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.38 1.84
3. 8/32 x 1/4 TOTAL 2.38 1.84

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.42 1.61
4. 8/32 x 3/8 TOTAL 2.42 1.61

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 3.50 2.11
5. 10/24 x 3/8 TOTAL 3.50 2.11

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.80 2.50
6. 10/24 x 1/2 TOTAL 2.80 2.50
  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.74 4.22
7. 1/4 x 3/8 TOTAL 5.74 4.22

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 5.51 4.36
8. 1/4 x 1/2 TOTAL 5.51 4.36

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 15.61 9.42
9. 5/16 x 3/8 TOTAL 15.61 9.42

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 11.91 7.52
10. 5/16 x 1/2 TOTAL 11.91 7.52

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 23.18 22.72
11. 3/8 x 1/2 TOTAL 23.18 22.72

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 21.04 26.23
12. 3/8 x 5/8 TOTAL 21.04 26.23
  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 113.72 132.89
13. 7/16 x 1/2 TOTAL 113.72 132.89
   UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 118.67 210.73
14. 7/16 x 5/8 TOTAL 118.67 210.73
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PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 23.50 73.43
15. 7/16 x 3/4 TOTAL 23.50 73.43

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 72.09 140.79
16. 1/2 x 1/2 TOTAL 72.09 140.79

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 55.86 37.91
17. 1/2 x 5/8 TOTAL 55.86 37.91

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 24.21 29.86
18. 1/2 x 3/4 TOTAL 24.21 29.86
  UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 164.40 196.50
19. 3/4 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 164.40 196.50

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 56.65 64.71
20. 5/8 x 1 TOTAL 56.65 64.71

 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 58.16 71.39
21. 5/8 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 58.16 71.39

 

TOTAL FOR ITEM 14 TOTAL 785.07 1,042.91
 ITEM 15:  SELF DRILLING SCREWS WITH HEX WASHER HEAD, SAWS NO. 32217 UNIT

1,600 ea.     PRICE 4.55 3.12
1. 8 x 1" TOTAL 72.80 49.92

 UNIT

1,600 ea. PRICE 11.90 4.25
2. 10 x 1" TOTAL 190.40 68.00

 UNIT

1,600 ea. PRICE 16.22 5.80
3. 12 x 1" TOTAL 259.52 92.80

TOTAL FOR ITEM 15 TOTAL 522.72 210.72
  

GRAND TOTAL FOR GROUP I TOTAL 48,410.57 50,343.26

Fastenal
Manufacturer/Vendor Price Sheet

Current Listing
Effective Date of Price Sheet

40%
Discount off Price Sheet
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N/A

Multiplier for Discount
GROUP II ITEM 1: BOLTS, MACHINE HEXAGON HEAD, NC THREAD - BLACK & PLATED, SAWS NO. 32218UNIT

1,000 ea.                PRICE 3.62 5.05
1. 1/4" x 2 TOTAL 36.20 50.50

 UNIT

1,000 ea.               PRICE 6.84 5.84
2. 5/16" x 2 TOTAL 68.40 58.40

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 9.60 11.07
3. 3/8" x 2 TOTAL 96.00 110.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 12.38 15.10
4. 7/16" x 2 TOTAL 123.80 151.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 12.26 21.71
5. 1/2" x 2 TOTAL 122.60 217.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 18.06 34.04
6. 5/8" x 2" TOTAL 180.60 340.40

TOTAL FOR ITEM 1 TOTAL 627.60 928.10
ITEM 2:  BOLTS, CARRIAGE, ROUND HEAD, SQUARE NECK, NC THREADED WITHOUT NUTS UNIT

SAWS NO. 32219
1,000 ea.                 PRICE 2.35 5.27

1. 1/4" X 2" TOTAL 23.50 52.70
 UNIT

1,000 ea.  PRICE 3.95 8.98
2. 5/16" x 2" TOTAL 39.50 89.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 5.90 12.76
3. 3/8" x 2" TOTAL 59.00 127.60

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 14.34 18.59
4. 7/16" x 2" TOTAL 143.40 185.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 14.78 24.83
5. 1/2" x 2" TOTAL 147.80 248.30

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 19.20 45.53
6. 5/8" x 2" TOTAL 192.00 455.30

TOTAL FOR ITEM 2 TOTAL 605.20 1,159.60
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DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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ITEM 3:  BOLTS, STOVE, ROUND AND FLAT W/HEXAGON NUTS, SAWS NO. 32220 UNIT

1,000 ea.                 PRICE 2.00 0.76
1. 1/8" x 1" TOTAL 20.00 7.60

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 2.00 2.58
2. 1/4" x 1" TOTAL 20.00 25.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea PRICE 2.00 1.38
3. 3/16" x 1" TOTAL 20.00 13.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 6.78 4.27
4. 5/16" x 1" TOTAL 67.80 42.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 7.02 7.15
5. 3/8" x 1" TOTAL 70.20 71.50

TOTAL FOR ITEM 3 TOTAL 198.00 161.40
ITEM 4:  CAP SCREWS, HEXAGON HEAD, DOUBLE HEAT, NC AND NF THREAD, SAWS NO. 32221UNIT

1,000 ea.                 PRICE 6.19 6.40
1. 1/4" X 2" TOTAL 61.90 64.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 8.72 9.89
2. 5/16" x 2" TOTAL 87.20 98.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 12.10 14.29
3. 3/8" x 2" TOTAL 121.00 142.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 18.82 19.70
4. 7/16" x 2" TOTAL 188.20 197.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 23.25 20.00
5. 1/2" x 2" TOTAL 232.50 200.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 37.80 44.93
6. 5/8" x 2" TOTAL 378.00 449.30

TOTAL FOR ITEM 4 TOTAL 1,068.80 1,152.10
ITEM 5:  SCREWS, MACHINE, FLAT, ROUND AND OVAL HEAD STEEL, SAWS NO. 32222 UNIT

1,000 ea.                PRICE 1.10 0.94
1. 6/32" x 1" TOTAL 11.00 9.40

 UNIT

1,000 ea.      PRICE 1.34 1.52
2. 8/32" x 1" TOTAL 13.40 15.20

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.72 2.00
3. 10x32" x 1" TOTAL 17.20 20.00
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 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.76 3.23
4. 1/4" x 1" TOTAL 17.60 32.30

TOTAL FOR ITEM 5 TOTAL 59.20 76.90
ITEM 6:  SCREWS, WOOD, FLAT, ROUND AND OVAL HEAD, SAWS NO. 32223 UNIT

1,000 ea.                 PRICE 2.22 0.95
1. #6 x 1" TOTAL 22.20 9.50

 UNIT

1,000 ea.      PRICE 2.06 1.42
2. #8 x 1" TOTAL 20.60 14.20

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 3.29 1.68
3. #10 x 1" TOTAL 32.90 16.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.97 1.62
4. #12 x 1" TOTAL 19.70 16.20

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 4.54 2.95
5. #14 x 1" TOTAL 45.40 29.50

TOTAL FOR ITEM 6 TOTAL 140.80 86.20
ITEM 7:  SCREWS, SHEET METAL, STANDARD HEAD STYLES STEEL, SAWS NO. 32224 UNIT

1,000 ea.                PRICE 1.02 1.06
1. #6 x 1" TOTAL 10.20 10.60

 UNIT

1,000 ea.      PRICE 1.01 1.69
2. #8 x 1" TOTAL 10.10 16.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.26 2.18
3. #10 x 1" TOTAL 12.60 21.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 2.03 2.97
4. #12 x 1" TOTAL 20.30 29.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 2.18 3.72
5. #14 x 1" TOTAL 21.80 37.20

TOTAL FOR ITEM 7 TOTAL 75.00 116.20
ITEM 8:  NUT, HEXAGON STEEL, SEMI-FINISHED NC AND NF THREAD STEEL PLATED, UNIT

SAWS NO. 32225
1,000 ea.                PRICE 0.89 1.02

1. 1/4" TOTAL 8.90 10.20
 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.22 1.58
2. 5/16" TOTAL 12.20 15.80
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 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.76 2.38
3. 3/8" TOTAL 17.60 23.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 3.16 4.23
4. 7/16" TOTAL 31.60 42.30

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 4.15 5.51
5. 1/2" TOTAL 41.50 55.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 6.64 11.28
6. 5/8" TOTAL 66.40 112.80

TOTAL FOR ITEM 8 TOTAL 178.20 260.00
ITEM 9:  NUTS, HEAXAGON MACHINE SCREW, SAWS NO. 32226 UNIT

1,000 ea.                PRICE 1.50 0.57
1. 6/32" TOTAL 15.00 5.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea.  PRICE 0.98 0.67
2. 8/32" TOTAL 9.80 6.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.10 1.31
3. 10/32" TOTAL 11.00 13.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 0.43 1.00
4. 1/4" TOTAL 4.30 10.00

TOTAL FOR ITEM 9 TOTAL 40.10 35.50
ITEM 10:  WASHERS, FLAT STEEL, WROUGHT, SAWS NO. 32227 UNIT

500 ea.                 PRICE 2.40 0.83
1. 1/4", Plain TOTAL 12.00 4.15

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.06 0.91
2. 5/16", Plain TOTAL 5.30 4.55

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.44 1.02
3. 3/8", Plain TOTAL 7.20 5.10

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 4.13 2.41
4. 1/2", Plain TOTAL 20.65 12.05

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 3.42 2.41
5. 7/16", Plain TOTAL 17.10 12.05

 UNIT

500 ea., Plain PRICE 8.30 3.62
6. 5/8", Plain TOTAL 41.50 18.10
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 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 0.61 0.86
7. 1/4", Plated TOTAL 3.05 4.30

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 0.74 1.06
8. 5/16", Plated TOTAL 3.70 5.30

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.20 1.50
9. 3/8", Plated TOTAL 6.00 7.50

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.37 3.29
10. 1/2", Plated TOTAL 11.85 16.45

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.17 1.69
11. 7/16", Plated TOTAL 10.85 8.45

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 5.15 5.77
12. 5/8", Plated TOTAL 25.75 28.85

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.40 0.83
13. 1/4", Bulk Plain TOTAL 12.00 4.15

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.06 0.91
14. 5/16", Bulk Plain TOTAL 5.30 4.55

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.44 1.02
15. 3/8", Bulk Plain TOTAL 7.20 5.10

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 3.84 2.41
16. 1/2", Bulk Plain TOTAL 19.20 12.05

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 3.17 1.22
17. 7/16", Bulk Plain TOTAL 15.85 6.10

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 7.71 3.62
18. 5/8", Bulk Plain TOTAL 38.55 18.10

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 0.52 0.86
19. 1/4", Bulk Plated TOTAL 2.60 4.30

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 0.62 1.06
20. 5/16" Bulk Plated TOTAL 3.10 5.30

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.01 1.50
21. 3/8", Bulk Plated TOTAL 5.05 7.50

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.46 3.29
22. 1/2", Bulk Plated TOTAL 12.30 16.45
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 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.25 1.69
23. 7/16", Bulk Plated TOTAL 11.25 8.45

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 5.15 5.77
24. 5/8", Bulk Plated TOTAL 25.75 28.85

TOTAL FOR ITEM 10 TOTAL 323.10 247.75
ITEM 11:  WASHERS, LOCK, STEEL, SAWS NO. 32228 UNIT

500 ea.                PRICE 0.63 0.52
1. 1/4", Plain TOTAL 3.15 2.60

 UNIT

500 ea.  PRICE 1.05 0.80
2. 5/16", Plain TOTAL 5.25 4.00

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.53 1.25
3. 3/8", Plain TOTAL 7.65 6.25

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 4.22 2.53
4. 1/2", Plain TOTAL 21.10 12.65

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.54 1.79
5. 7/16", Plain TOTAL 7.70 8.95

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 3.19 4.55
6. 5/8", Plain TOTAL 15.95 22.75

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 0.96 0.72
7. 1/4", Plated TOTAL 4.80 3.60

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 1.62 1.06
8. 5/16", Plated TOTAL 8.10 5.30

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.28 1.79
9. 3/8", Plated TOTAL 11.40 8.95

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.48 3.50
10. 1/2", Plated TOTAL 12.40 17.50

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 2.13 2.62
11. 7/16", Plated TOTAL 10.65 13.10

 UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 3.56 6.35
12. 5/8", Plated TOTAL 17.80 31.75

TOTAL FOR ITEM 11 TOTAL 125.95 137.40
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 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 11.38 15.61
1. 1/8" x 2", Round Head TOTAL 113.80 156.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 11.68 14.58
2. 3/16" x 2", Round Head TOTAL 116.80 145.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 20.50 20.52
3. 1/4" x 3", Round Head TOTAL 205.00 205.20

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 45.43 44.20
4. 3/8" x 3", Round Head TOTAL 454.30 442.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 11.38 NO BID
5. 1/8" x 2", Flat Head TOTAL 113.80  

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 11.68 NO BID
6. 3/16" x 2", Flat Head TOTAL 116.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 20.50 NO BID
7. 1/4" x 3", Flat Head TOTAL 205.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 45.43 NO BID
8. 3/8" x 3", Flat Head TOTAL 454.30

TOTAL FOR ITEM 12 TOTAL 1,779.80 949.10
ITEM 13:  COTTER PINS, SAWS NO. 32230 UNIT

1,000 ea.               PRICE 2.73 1.58
1. 1/8" dia. x 1-1/2" TOTAL 27.30 15.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 3.17 1.67
2. 1/8" x 2" TOTAL 31.70 16.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 5.36 2.37
3. 1/8" x 3" TOTAL 53.60 23.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 5.90 2.87
4. 3/16" x 1-1/2" TOTAL 59.00 28.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 7.37 3.29
5. 3/16" x 2" TOTAL 73.70 32.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea PRICE 9.22 4.97
6. 3/16 x 3" TOTAL 92.20 49.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 8.03 5.72
7. 1/4" x 1-1/2" TOTAL 80.30 57.20
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ITEM 12: FASTENERS, ANCHORS, SHIELDS, EXPANSION ANCHORS, MACHINE SCREWS AND 

BOLTS, CLOSED AND OPEN BOTTOM, TOGGLE BOLTS, ROUND AND FLAT HEAD, SAWS NO. 32229
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 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 8.63 6.05
8. 1/4" x 2" TOTAL 86.30 60.50

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 10.86 7.98
9. 1/4" x 3" TOTAL 108.60 79.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 12.40 10.58
10. 5/16" x 1-1/2" TOTAL 124.00 105.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 12.40 10.49
11. 5/16" x 2" TOTAL 124.00 104.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 16.84 16.25
12. 5/16" x 3" TOTAL 168.40 162.50

TOTAL FOR ITEM 13 TOTAL 1,029.10 738.20
ITEM 14:  BOLTS, MACHINE HEXAGON HEAD, NC THREAD PLATED GRADE 8, SAWS NO. 32231 UNIT

1,000 ea.             PRICE 39.23 43.79
1. 5/8" dia x 2" TOTAL 392.30 437.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 56.87 64.83
2. 5/8" dia x 3" TOTAL 568.70 648.30

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 74.96 81.98
3. 5/8" dia x 4" TOTAL 749.60 819.80

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 20.24 23.17
4. 7/16" dia x 2" TOTAL 202.40 231.70

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 28.10 32.11
5. 7/16" dia x 3" TOTAL 281.00 321.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 36.46 39.40
6. 7/16" dia x 4" TOTAL 364.60 394.00

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 25.27 28.46
7. 1/2" dia x 2" TOTAL 252.70 284.60

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 35.29 42.19
8. 1/2" dia x 3" TOTAL 352.90 421.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 46.65 53.05
9. 1/2" dia x 4" TOTAL 466.50 530.50

TOTAL FOR ITEM 14 TOTAL 3,630.70 4,089.80
ITEM 15:  RIVETS, SAWS NO. 32232 UNIT

1,000 ea.                PRICE 2.45 0.77
1. 3/32" dia. TOTAL 24.50 7.70
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.39 0.65
2. 1/8" dia. TOTAL 13.90 6.50

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 3.37 0.99
3. 5/32" dia. TOTAL 33.70 9.90

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.86 1.31
4. 3/16" dia. TOTAL 18.60 13.10

 UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 8.39 5.47
5. 1/4" dia. TOTAL 83.90 54.70

TOTAL FOR ITEM 15 TOTAL 174.60 91.90

GRAND TOTAL FOR GROUP II TOTAL 10,056.15 10,230.15

Fastenal
Manufacturer/Vendor Price Sheet

Current Listing
Effective Date of Price Sheet

40%
Discount off Price Sheet

N/A
Multiplier for Discount

GROUP III ITEM I:  FLAT WASHERS - STAINLESS STEEL TYPE 304SS, SAWS NO. 32233 UNIT

1,500 ea. PRICE 16.00 20.55
1. 5/8" TOTAL 240.00 308.25

UNIT

1,500 ea. PRICE 25.97 22.73
2. 3/4" TOTAL 389.55 340.95

UNIT

1,500 ea. PRICE 81.48 55.45
3. 1-1/8" TOTAL 1,222.20 831.75

UNIT

1,500 ea. PRICE 88.58 50.91
4. 1-1/4" TOTAL 1,328.70 763.65

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 108.56 94.10
5. 1-1/2" TOTAL 108.56 94.10

 

  

 TOTAL FOR ITEM 1 TOTAL 3,289.01 2,338.70
 ITEM 2: HEX NUTS, COARSE THREAD, SAWS NO. 32234 UNIT

15,000 ea. PRICE 28.31 28.35
1. 5/8" thread per in: 13 TOTAL 4,246.50 4,252.50
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SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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UNIT

1,500 ea. PRICE 45.25 43.95
2. 3/4" thread per in: 10 TOTAL 678.75 659.25

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 76.93 74.25
3. 7/8" thread per in: 9 TOTAL 384.65 371.25

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 95.90 118.80
4. 1" thread per in: 8 TOTAL 479.50 594.00

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 200.00 216.00
5. 1-1/8" thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,000.00 1,080.00

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 205.85 310.50
6. 1-1/4" thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,029.25 1,552.50

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 339.25 553.50
7. 1-1/2" thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,696.25 2,767.50

 

  

 TOTAL FOR ITEM 2 TOTAL 9,514.90 11,277.00
ITEM 3: HEX HEAD BOLTS, COARSE THREAD, SAWS NO. 32214 UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 71.33 58.32
1. 5/8 x 1 thread per in: 13 TOTAL 71.33 58.32

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 74.10 63.45
2. 5/8 x 1-1/4 thread per in: 13 TOTAL 74.10 63.45

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 78.61 67.50
3. 5/8 x 1-1/2 thread per in: 13 TOTAL 78.61 67.50

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 82.26 74.12
4. 5/8 x 1-3/4 thread per in: 13 TOTAL 82.26 74.12

UNIT

500 ea. PRICE 95.60 78.03
5. 5/8 x 2 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 478.00 390.15

UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 113.84 79.65
6. 5/8 x 2-1/2 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 2,846.00 1,991.25

UNIT

2,500 ea. PRICE 121.73 96.53
7. 5/8 x 3 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 3,043.25 2,413.25

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 124.80 129.47
8. 5/8 x 3-1/2 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 249.60 258.94

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 123.50 151.20
9. 5/8 x 4 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 123.50 151.20

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.42 160.65
10. 5/8 x 4-1/2 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 1.42 160.65
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.50 174.15
11. 5/8 x 5 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 1.50 174.15

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.77 199.80
12. 5/8 x 5-1/2 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 1.77 199.80

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.94 228.15
13. 5/8 x 6 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 1.94 228.15

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2.17 270.00
14. 5/8 x 6-1/2 thread per in: 11 TOTAL 2.17 270.00

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.30 275.40
15. 3/4 x 1 TOTAL 1.30 275.40

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 100.37 103.68
16. 3/4 x 1-1/4 TOTAL 100.37 103.68

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 114.99 110.70
17. 3/4 x 1-1/2 TOTAL 114.99 110.70

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 123.19 115.43
18. 3/4 x 1-3/4 TOTAL 123.19 115.43

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 125.14 123.53
19. 3/4 x 2 TOTAL 125.14 123.53

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.50 132.30
20. 3/4 x 2-1/4 TOTAL 1.50 132.30

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 151.20 144.45
21. 3/4 x 2-1/2 TOTAL 302.40 288.90

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1.74 168.75
22. 3/4 x 3 TOTAL 1.74 168.75

UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 1.73 186.30
23. 3/4 x 3-1/4 TOTAL 17.30 1,863.00

UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 186.00 202.50
24. 3/4 x 3-1/2 TOTAL 1,860.00 2,025.00

UNIT

1,000 ea. PRICE 177.80 218.70
25. 3/4 x 3-3/4 TOTAL 177.80 218.70

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 202.50 222.75
26. 3/4 x 4 TOTAL 202.50 222.75
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 202.50 257.85
27. 3/4 x 4-1/2 thread per in: 10 TOTAL 202.50 257.85

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 236.25 283.50
28. 3/4 x 5 TOTAL 236.25 283.50

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 266.50 326.70
29 3/4 x 6 TOTAL 266.50 326.70

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 198.80 217.35
30. 7/8 x 2 TOTAL 198.80 217.35

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 184.95 236.25
31. 7/8 x 2-1/2 thread per in: 9 TOTAL 184.95 236.25

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 197.50 261.90
32. 7/8 x 3 thread per in: 9 TOTAL 197.50 261.90

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 208.75 301.05
33. 7/8 x 3-1/2 thread per inch 9 TOTAL 208.75 301.05

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 222.50 310.50
34. 7/8 x 3-3/4 thread per inch 9 TOTAL 222.50 310.50

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 281.60 321.30
35. 7/8 x 4 TOTAL 563.20 642.60

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 263.90 348.30
36. 7/8 x 4-1/2 TOTAL 527.80 696.60

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 299.00 396.90
37. 7/8 x 5 TOTAL 299.00 396.90

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1,213.75 1,142.10
38. 7/8 x 10 TOTAL 1,213.75 1,142.10

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 237.50 272.70
39. 1 x 2 thread per in: 8 TOTAL 237.50 272.70

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 242.50 333.40
40. 1 x 2-1/2 thread per in: 8 TOTAL 242.50 333.40

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 282.50 379.35
41. 1 x 3 thread per in: 8 TOTAL 282.50 379.35

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 331.25 494.10
42. 1 x 4 thread per in: 8 TOTAL 331.25 494.10
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TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Biennial Contract for

FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY F
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UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 350.00 596.70
43. 1 x 4-1/2 thread per in 8 TOTAL 350.00 596.70

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 393.75 610.20
44. 1 x 5 thread per in: 8 TOTAL 393.75 610.20

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 568.75 721.00
45. 1-1/8 x 2-3/4 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 568.75 721.00

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 694.80 1,039.50
46. 1-1/8 x 5 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 694.80 1,039.50

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1,515.60 1,418.85
47. 1-1/8 x 7 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,515.60 1,418.85

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 871.25 891.00
48. 1-1/4 x 3 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,742.50 1,782.00

UNIT

200 ea. PRICE 820.00 945.00
49. 1-1/4 x 3-1/2 thread p er in: 7 TOTAL 1,640.00 1,890.00

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 972.50 1,053.00
50. 1-1/4 x 4-1/2 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 972.50 1,053.00

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 955.20 1,250.00
51. 1-1/4 x 4-3/4 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 2,865.60 3,750.00

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 955.20 1,336.50
52. 1-1/4 x 5-1/2 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 2,865.60 4,009.50

UNIT

300 ea. PRICE 1,089.60 1,424.25
53. 1-1/4 x 6 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 3,268.80 4,272.75

UNIT

 200 ea. PRICE 1,331.25 1,494.45
54. 1-1/4 x 6-1/2 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 2,662.50 2,988.90

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1,840.00 2,250.00
55. 1-1/2 x 5-3/4 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,840.00 2,250.00

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1,766.40 2,335.50
56. 1-1/2 x 6 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,766.40 2,335.50

UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 2,007.60 2,536.65
57. 1/2 x 6-1/2 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 2,007.60 2,536.65
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FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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UNIT

100 ea. PRICE 1,707.60 2,578.50
58. 1/2 x 7 thread per in: 7 TOTAL 1,707.60 2,578.50

TOTAL FOR ITEM 3 TOTAL 42,360.93 52,534.97

GRAND TOTAL FOR GROUP III TOTAL 55,164.84 66,150.67
 

TOTAL FOR GROUPS I, II & III (1 YEAR)  113,631.56  

TOTAL FOR GROUPS I, II & III (1 YEAR) 227,263.12

Fastenal
Manufacturer/Vendor Price Sheet

Current Listing
Effective Date of Price Sheet

40%
Discount off Price Sheet

N/A
Multiplier for Discount

 

EXTENSION 1 113,631.56

EXTENSION 2 113,631.56

EXTENSION 3 113,631.56

Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days

Delivery
 
*LOW BIDDER  
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FOR: Fasteners, Stainless Steel, Bolts, Screws, Anchors & Rivets 
TIME & (March 1, 2017 through December 31, 2018)
DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 16, 2017
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BIDS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Ace Bolts Demandstar
Alamo Bolt & Screw SAWS Website
Fastener Service & Supply

FastServ Supply

Fiesta Bolt

HK Fastener

Longhorn Bolt

NAPPCO Fastener Co.

PD Morrison Enterprises Inc.

Pro Fastener

Quality Fasteners

SWT Quality Fasteners
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